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Authority: Government Paperwork Elimination Act (Pub. L. 105-277, 44 U.S.C. 3504); 33 
U.S.C. 1368; 42 U.S.C. 7606; Executive Order 11738, Providing for administration of the Clean 
Air Act and the Federal Water Pollution Control Act with respect to Federal contracts, grants, or 
loans (38 FR 25161, 3 CFR, 1971-1975 Comp., p. 799); Executive Order 12549, Debarment and 
Suspension (51 FR 6370, 3 CFR, 1986 Comp., p. 189); Executive Order 12689 (54 FR 34131, 3 
CFR, 1989 Comp., p. 235); the Federal Acquisition Streamlining Act of 1994, Public Law 103-
355, 31 U.S.C. 6101 note; 2 CFR part 180—the Office of Management and Budget Guidelines to 
Agencies on Governmentwide Debarment and Suspension (Nonprocurement); 2 CFR part 
1532—Nonprocurement Debarment and Suspension; and the Federal Acquisition Regulation, 48 
CFR subpart 9.4—Debarment, Suspension, and Ineligibility. 
 
Purpose: The information collected may be used in processing, investigating, and maintaining 
records relevant to suspension and debarment case actions. Records in this system will be used to 
ensure that Federal contracts and Federal assistance, loans, and benefits are awarded to 
responsible business entities and individuals.  
 
Routine Uses: The information may be disclosed to governmentwide databases – the System for 
Award Management and the Federal Awardee Performance and Integrity Information System; 
individual respondents and related respondents; coordinating federal agencies; and federal, state, 
or local agencies, financial institutions or other entities seeking to verify an individual’s 
eligibility for engaging in federal procurement or covered transactions. For a complete 
description of the routine uses, please consult the Federal Register notice for the Case 
Application for Debarment and Suspension system of records, published at 86 Fed. Reg. 30040 
(June 4, 2021), also found at https://www.regulations.gov/document/EPA-HQ-OMS-2020-0281-
0001.  
 
Mandatory or voluntary disclosure and the effects on the individual of not providing 
information: Providing information to the Office of Mission Support is voluntary. However, if 
you decide not to provide any information, the Office of Mission Support will base its decisions 
solely on existing information in the record.  
 
 


